
March onto the stages at The Continent
Hotel Bangkok

Medinii, an Italian-inspired Diner at The Continent Hotel Bangkok in Asoke, revamps its business
lunch with local and sustainable produce, in order to promote less wastage and more freshness.
Guests have the option of choosing a main course from a new a la carte menu. Keeping high value in
mind, lunch is at THB 699 or THB 899 net per person including a main course.

Lunch: Whilst continuing to cater to the quick business lunch as well as the relaxed bunch, Medinii
is taking a “sustainable” approach. Using local produce, freshness and reduced wastage as guiding
forces, the traditional lunch and brunch will be replaced by a high value “free flow lunch”. Freshly
produced daily soup, salad and dessert bar will be from the buffet, pasta and pizza will be made to
order and flow freely.

Dinner: Medinii’s popular free-flow deal opens up two seating times to offer more opportunities for
early and late diners, providing more seatings and thus opportunities for those wishing to take
advantage of the free flow dining which we have aptly named – The Sundowner and The Twilighter.

• The Sundowner: 5:30 – 8:00 pm. An ideal time to enjoy the breathtaking views of the sunset with a
drink in your hand, be it an after work function or a social affair, with plenty of time to come home
to the family or rest with your feet up after a delicious free flow meal.
• The Twilighter: 8:15 – 10:45 pm. Working late or enjoy the nightlife, Twiligthers may enjoy the
twinkling city lights of the city as they dine on free flow (made-to-order) pizza and pasta: + a main
meal and dessert, including an endless selection of alcoholic beverages. A great start to an evening,
in preparation to party the night away.

Free-Flow Dining provides unbeatable value starting at THB 999++ per person including a free flow
of pasta, pizza, a choice of a main meal and a dessert, including a free flow of curated alcoholic
drinks. In addition guests can choose a main course and dessert from the a la Carte menu. Window
tables can be reserved for both individuals as well as smaller groups from THB 1499++ per person.

Sundowner and Twilighter are available from Monday to Sunday, for reservation and more
information, please contact 02-686 7000 or Email: dining@thecontinenthotel.com.
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