
Little Creatures to be Let Loose at Venues’
Brewski

Brewski rooftop bar is proud to host the Thailand launch of a new craft beer

Venues’ Brewski is proud to host the debut of Little Creatures Craft Beer in Thailand, an event
eagerly awaited by local and international beer connoisseurs.

Wednesday, April 5, 2017, is a special day in the calendars of everyone who is serious about beer. It
marks the moment when Brewski, Bangkok’s highest rooftop craft beer bar, in collaboration with B-
delicious!, will launch a selection of five new beers created by one of Australia’s finest breweries,
Little Creatures, for the very first time in the Kingdom.

Lovingly named after the microorganisms that make the production of beer possible in the first
place, Little Creatures was founded by a group of friends with the mission to share their creativity
and love for craft beer with the world. Their passion and devotion to this project can be felt in all
their aromatic brews, each telling a very distinct story through its characteristic flavors and unique
composition of ingredients from around the world.

Whether guests would enjoy a smooth, malty Amber Ale to go with hearty flavorful dishes, a strong
hoppy India Pale Ale to complement spicy chili-laden foods, a crisp fruity Bright Ale for slightly
milder dishes or a refreshing balanced Original Pilsner made with ingredients from Germany to
accompany light salads, there will be something for everyone. Those who find it hard to choose can
try the full-bodied Pale Ale with hops from the USA and New Zealand. It is great by itself or as a
versatile all-rounder when it comes to pairing with Brewski’s delicious foods.

Originally started in Fremantle, Western Australia, Little Creatures quickly won the hearts of beer
aficionados around Australia, making it necessary to open a second brewery on the country’s east
coast to satisfy the growing demand for their special, well-balanced beers. Thanks to impeccable
ingredients such as hops sourced from leading production regions in the USA, New Zealand and
Germany, and the master brewers’ creativity and skill, these beers all have their very own character
that is sure to take Bangkok’s craft beer community by storm.

“As Bangkok’s top destination for beer lovers, it was with great pleasure that we worked together
with B-delicious! to make the launch of Little Creatures in Thailand a great success. Their beers
really tell a story and we are looking forward to letting it unfold here at Brewski,” says Radisson
BLU Plaza’s General Manager Peter Feran.

# # #
About Brewski
Located on the 30th floor, Brewski is Bangkok’s best spot for brews and views. The drinks menu
features one dozen craft beers on tap in addition to a whopping 100 bottled varieties from around
the world. At Asok junction within brief walking distance of the city’s BTS SkyTrain and MRT
underground transport systems. Brewski is open daily from 17:00 – 01.00 hrs (last orders 00.30). For
more information, visit www.venuesbkk.com/brewski.php, email info.bangkok.blu@radisson.com or
call +66(0) 2 302 3333.
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About Venues:
VENUES is a collection of six distinctive restaurants and bars offering Thai, expatriate residents and
international visitors an appealing new dining and entertainment destination in Bangkok to gather
and enjoy world class creative cuisine, memorable social occasions and inspiring cityscape views.
The six outlets all share the same downtown address at Radisson Blu Plaza Bangkok on the capital’s
main artery Sukhumvit Road. Once visitors step inside they discover an eclectic epicurean adventure
that extends from the ground floor lounge through a series of world class restaurants on Levels 2, 3,
28, 29, and culminates in Bangkok’s highest rooftop craft beer bar, Brewski, on Level 30. For more
information, visit www.venuesbkk.com, email info.bangkok.blu@radisson.com or call +66(0) 2 302
3333.

About Radisson Blu Plaza Bangkok
Radisson Blu® is one of the world’s leading hotel brands, an emblem of genuine, contemporary
hospitality all enhanced by Radisson’s distinctive Yes I CanSM! service philosophy. Radisson Blu
Plaza Bangkok offers 266 stylish guest rooms and 24 elegant suites, in addition to state-of-the-art
meeting facilities and outstanding dining and leisure options. In the heart of Bangkok on Sukhumvit
Road, Radisson Blu Plaza Bangkok is easily reached from both of Bangkok’s international airports.
The hotel’s location near Asok junction likewise allows for easy access to the city’s elevated rail and
underground public transport systems. Nearby the hotel are many of the Thai capital’s major
cultural, commercial, entertainment and shopping sites. Designed for business and leisure guests
who know how to travel in style, Radisson Blu Plaza Bangkok defines the modern hotel experience.
Learn more at www.radissonblu.com/plazahotel-bangkok.
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